G i
CE . -
e

i
s e
: ,;: LaieaResae
A e -
RS 3 = - -
e 7 o 7
Sl V -
SR . -
Gplte e o R
Sl !
o Lot
5 e
T e

i F
e
i
- : L g
i Gk .
o

e e
o sy e
e

e : e
. : S et
: T s i : -
%“w%q‘gz‘“% é ‘ .
e - -
-
e

R

A a“?“a{’?i
S

LR
e

5
-

e e

T e i

i

ey
2 a
e G 7
s

G

njg}:ﬁ AT

é e
L s
S 5 o
s %
el

S
it

i

S
\\.icaz,?as o
I

s
St

T
e

: e e
el

ey

£ % R A
4 wgw e = s
e S e e e
Ees s e
GrEnET 7 el
Gy x:%ﬁ?f’_w AR 5

i

; v
TR il . - :.“N, > ,_: »-f':;,,,y:,j
o s . . k -
e = e e .
- = 1 9
st Sheoien vl
. e b

. ; -

e ‘
e =
=

L
o o S H s
e
3 o

G
G
s

: Sada
S
i R
i i
P
R



Joseeh, Sha'!an

From: Reynolds, Corbett

Sent: Saturday, April 19, 2014 11:17 PM

To: Smith, Daniel

Cc: Mastronardi, Marc; Bolden, Mike; Sammons, Matthew; Hobby, James; Gibbs, Bryan;
Lindsey, Jamie; Joseph, Shajan; Upkins, Lee; Bean, Lynn

Subject: RE: CSSTP-0006-00(476) Dodge-Laurens Counties- City of Eastman Utility Aid Approval

Letter (Watern)

Daniel,

Please call your contractor ASAP to discuss a SA to complete the relocation work for the City of Eastman. Plans and
guantities should be available by May 1. Contact me if you have any questions.

Thanks,

Corbett

From: Upkins, Lee

Sent: Friday, April 18, 2014 2:27 PM

To: Reynolds, Corbett; Bean, Lynn

Cc: Mastronardi, Marc; Bolden, Mike; Sammons, Matthew; Hobby, James; Gibbs, Bryan; Lindsey, Jamie; Joseph, Shajan
Subject: FW: CSSTP-0006-00(476) Dodge-Laurens Counties- City of Eastman Utility Aid Approval Letter (Water)
Importance: High

Good Afternoon Mr. Reynolds,

As you know, this project went into escalation due to the fact, the City facilities was in conflict with the proposed
drainage structures. As part of the mitigation, we obtained Utility Aid for the City facilities in conflict to be relocated by
the Contractor. By completing the SA, this should eliminate this escalation process.

The District Utilities Office is currently working on getting complete relocation plans from the City by May 1, 2014.
Please discuss with the Contractor so they will be on board for the relocation work. If the Contractor is unwilling to
complete/hire a subcontractor to complete the work, please let the DUE or my office know as soon as possible so | can
look at getting the City to hire a contractor to complete their relocation work.

Once the SA is completed, please let my office know so we can help with any funding requirement for this additional
work.

Thanks

Lee Upkins

Assistant State Utilities Engineer
Department of Transportation

Office of Utilities - One Georgia Center
600 West Peachtree Street, 10™ Floor
Atlanta, Georgia 30308

Office; 404-631-1354

Email: lupkins@dot.ga.gov




From: Upkins, Lee

Sent: Friday, April 18, 2014 1:29 PM

To: Golden, Keith; McMurry, Russell; Pirkle, Meg; Bolden, Mike; Gable, Terry; Robinson, Angie; Smith, Jimmy

Cc: Madaris, Charis; Heath, Andrew; Bean, Lynn; O'Brien, Neal; Birnkammer, Jun; 'Munshi, Abdulvahid’; Belford, Charity;
Reynolds, Corbett; Mastronardi, Marc

Subject: CSSTP-0006-00(476) Dodge-Laurens Counties- City of Eastman Utility Aid Approval Letter (Water)

Ladies and Gentlemen,

Attached is an electrenic copy of the Utility-Aid approval letter for the City of Eastman on the above referenced

project. A hard caopy of this letter was sent to the City and the GDOT Board member, today April 18, 2014, A hard copy
wiil not be distributed to interdepartmental personnel. If there are any questions or concerns please feel free to contact
me.

Thanks

Lee Upkins

Assistant State Utilities Engineer
Department of Transportation

Office of Utilities - One Georgia Center
600 West Peachtree Street, 10™ Floor
Atlanta, Georgia 30308

Office: 404-631-1354

Email: lupkins@dot.ga.gov

Georgia DOT commits $7 million per year to an Off-System Safety Improvement Program designed to reduce fatalities
and serious injuries on rural roads owned and maintained by local governments throughout Georgia. Thus far in FY2014,
GDOT has administered approximately $6.5 million of federal funds for local assistance in 78 counties. Visit us at
hitp://www.dot.ga.qgov (Local Government link) or fellow us on htip://www.facebook.com/GeorgiaDOT and
htte:/twitter.com/gadeptoftrans.




Joseeh, Sha'!an

From: Upkins, Lee

Sent: Friday, April 18, 2014 2:27 PM

To: Reynolds, Corbett; Bean, Lynn

Cc: Mastrenardi, Marc; Bolden, Mike; Sammons, Matthew; Hobby, James; Gibbs, Bryan;
Lindsey, Jamie; Joseph, Shajan

Subject: FW: CSSTP-0006-00(476) Dodge-Laurens Counties- City of Eastman Utility Aid Approval
Letter (Water)

Attachments: - 0006476 Dodge-Laurens - UA Approval Letter City of Eastman. pdf

Importance: High

Good Afternoon Mr. Reynolds, .

As you know, this project went into escalation due to the fact, the City facilities was in conflict with the proposed
drainage structures. As part of the mitigation, we obtained Utility Aid for the City facilities in conflict to be relocated by
the Contractor. By completing the $4, this should eliminate this escalation process.

The District Utilities Office is currently working on getting complete relocation plans from the City by May 1, 2014.
Please discuss with the Contractor so they will be on board for the refocation work. If the Contractor is unwilling to
complete/hire a subcontractor to complete the work, please let the DUE or my office know as soon as possible so | can
look at getting the City to hire a contractor to complete their relocation work.

Once the SA is completed, please let my office know so we can help with any funding requirement for this additional
work,

Thanks

Lee Upkins

Assistant State Utilities Engineer
Department of Transportation

Office of Utilities - One Georgia Cenfer
600 West Peachtree Street, 10" Floor
Atlanta, Georgia 30308

Office: 404-631-1354

Email: lupkins@dot.ga.gov

From: Upkins, Lee

Sent: Friday, April 18, 2014 1:29 PM

To: Golden, Keith; McMurry, Russell; Pirkle, Meg; Bolden, Mike; Gable, Terry; Robinson, Angie; Smith, Jimmy

Cc: Madaris, Charis; Heath, Andrew; Bean, Lynn; O'Brien, Neal; Birnkammer, Jun; ‘Munshi, Abdulvahid'; Belford, Charity;

Reynolds, Corbett; Mastronardi, Marc
Subject: CSSTP-0006-00(476) Dodge-Laurens Counties- City of Eastman Utility Aid Approval Letter (Water)

Ladies and Gentlemen,

Attached is an electronic copy of the Utility-Aid approval letter for the City of Eastman on the above referenced
project. A hard copy of this letter was sent to the City and the GDOT Board member, today April 18, 2014. A hard copy




will not be distributed to interdepartmental personnel. If there are any questions or concerns please feel free to contact
me. '

Thanks

Lee Upkins

Assistant State Utilities Engineer
Department of Transportation

Office of Utilities - One Georgia Center
600 West Peachtree Street, 10™ Floor
Atlanta, Georgia 30308

Office: 404-631-1354

Email: lupkins@dot.ga.gov

Georgia DOT commits $7 million per year to an Off-System Safety Improvement Program designed to reduce fatalities
and serious injuries on rural roads owned and maintained by local governments throughout Georgia. Thus far in FY2014,
GDOT has administered approximately $6.5 million of federal funds for local assistance in 78 counties. Visit us at
htip://www.dot.ga.gov (Local Government link) or follow us on hitp://iwww.facebook.com/GeorgiaDOT and

hitp:/ftwitter.com/gadeptottrans.




Keith Golden, P.E., Commissioner DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

One Georgla Center, 600 West Peachtree Street, NW
Allanta, Georgia 30308
Telephone: (404) 631-1000

April 18,2014

Bea Edge

City Manager

City of Eastman

Post Office Drawer 40
Eastman, Georgia 31023

Georgia Project: CSSTP-0006-00(476) Dodge-Laurens Counties

GDOT PI No.: PI 0006476
Utility-Aid Approval, SR 17 from Eastman City Limits to SR 31/US 441
Water Facilities

Dear Bea Edge:

The Department has approved funding for the City’s Utility-Aid request for the above project. The Department
believes these costs were unforeseeable and considering the costs in comparison with your operating budget, the
Department will assume 100% of the construction cost of the utility facilities in conflict with the proposed
project excluding betterment, currently estimated at $58,237.00. The City will be responsible for 100% of the
preliminary engineeting costs associated with relocation design of the subject facilities. The following general
requirements shall apply to this aid:

1. The City will routinely budget for potential relocation liabilities for permitted facilities on right of way
under the jurisdiction of the Department. The City may be asked to provide verification that this
responsibility is met prior to approval of permits.

2. All relocation work required for this project shall be included in the Department’s project contract.
Therefore the City will enter into a Memorandum of Understanding (MOU) with the Department to
perform the utility relocation required for this project. In this MOU the City will agree that construction
engineering and contract supervision shall be the responsibility of the GDOT and the GDOT shall be
responsible to assure that all utility work is accomplished in accordance with plans and specifications
and to consult with the City before authorizing any changes or deviations which affect the City’s
facility,,_The City must coordinate with the Department’s District Office to ensure that arrangements are
made to ensure that the relocation plans are prepared to meet the Department’s schedule and plan
standards.

3. The City shall ensure that engineering for this work is performed according to current Department
Standards. The City must coordinate with the Department’s District Office so arrangements are made to
ensure that the engineering is completed and approved by May 1, 2014 without further delay to the
project’s schedule. :




Bea Edge, City Manager — City of Eastman

CSSTP-0006-00(476) Dodge-Laurens Counties

PI 0006476 - Utility-Aid Approval, SR 17 from Eastman City Limits to SR 31/US 441
Water Facilities

April 18,2014

4. The Department cannot bear the cost of any “betterment” items. The City may use this opportunity to
upgrade its facilities if paying the net increase in cost by coordinating with our District Office. Any
betterment will be addressed under a separate Utility Agreement so that the Department may be
reimbursed by the City.

Please make completion of preliminary engineering an urgent matter and continue coordination with the District
Utilities Office to finalize arrangements. All such correspondence should be sent to the following address:

Mr. Lynn Bean

District 2 Utilities Engineer

Georgia Department of Transportation
801 Hwy 15 South

Tennille, GA 31809

If there are any questions about this approval, please call me at 404-631-1354.

Sincerely,

L S Al

Michael J. Bolden
State Utilities Engineer
MJB: LEU

CC: Jamie Boswell, Board Member
Keith Golden, P.E., Commissioner
Russell McMurry, P.E., Chief Engineer
Angie Robinson, Financial Management Administrator
Terry Gable, State Aid Administrator
James H. Smith, District 2 Engineer, Tennille
Lynn Bean, District 2 Utilities Engineer
Neal O’Brien, District 2 Preconstruction Engineer
Utility-Aid File
Project File




Joseeh, Shaian

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Lynn/Matthew,

Upkins, Lee

Monday, March 17, 2014 7:49 AM

Sammons, Matthew; Joseph, Shajan; Bean, Lynn
Bolden, Mike; Lindsey, Jamie

RE: escalation letter CSSTP-0006-00(476)

Can you get with the City and ask the following questions;

1. Do they have a probiem with our contractor doing the work once their designer complete the relocation plans

2. What will be the time frame for having relocaticn plans complete for the Contractor, if they are acceptable to
the Department doing the work,

3. If they can budget for the work, the Department will pay the contractor than the City can reimburse the
Department back out of their FY 15 funds

4. If not funds, we will still need information for Utility Aid to provide work at no cost or reduced cost.

5. Do they have a contractor on standby if 100% Utility Aid is approved. Can they start immediately after plans are

approved.

Once we have an idea on which way to head, we can complete the process.

Mike Bolden is checking with Construction now to determine if a SA is agreeable with their office.

Thanks

Lee Upkins

Assistant State Utilities Engi
Department of Transportation
Office of Utilitics - One Georg
600 West Peachtree Street, 10"
Atlanta, Georgia 30308

Office: 404-631-1354

Email: lupkins@dot.ga.gov

From: Sammons, Matthew
Sent: Friday, March 14, 2014 1:0
To: Joseph, Shajan; Bean, Lynn
Cc: Upkins, Lee; Bolden, Mike; Lir
Subject: RE: escalation letter CS!

FYI

From: Joseph, Shajan

Sent: Friday, March 14, 2014 11:54 AM

To: Bean, Lynn

Cc: Sammons, Matthew; Upkins, Lee; Bolden, Mike; Lindsey, Jamie
Subject: RE: escalation letter CSSTP-0006-00(476)

Good Morning Lynn:




| went through the contractor’s letter and have a discussion with Mr. Lee Upkins.

Action Plan:

1. You have to request a letter and financial situation/details from City of Eastman. (| think
Lee already talked to you earlier about this)

2. Once we receive this letter, Lee and Mike will talk to the Construction Office / Upper
Management about this issue and try to resolve the issue for the money.

3. If we receive the money, we may ask the City of Eastman to submit an estimate for the

 removal/ relocation/ adjustment of their facility.

4. District Construction Estimator will review the estimate, based on quantities and the
unit price.

5. If it is an acceptable price, we may ask the City of Eastman to do the job otherwise we
may ask the contractor to do the job through an SA.

Immediate Steps:

1. A letter from the City Of Eastman explain the situation about the financial crisis and

present Financial Situation.
2. The details and amount of work and an estimate they are forecasting to complete this

job.

So, please contact the City of Eastman and obtain the “Immediate Steps” details and
forwarded to Lee or me.

If you have any questions or need any additional information, please let me know.

Thanks.

Shajan P. Joseph, P.E.

State Utilities Construction Enginecy
Georgia Department of Transportation
Office of Utilities ~ 10" Floor[1014]
600 West Peachtree St, NW

Atlanta, GA - 30308

Phone: (404)347-0604




Cell: (404)272-9264
E-mail: sjoseph(@

Keeping Georgia on the Move

From: Bean, Lynn

Sent: Friday, March 14, 2014 9:18 AM

To: Upkins, Lee; Bolden, Mike; Joseph, Shajan
Cc: Sammons, Matthew

Subject: escalation letter CSSTP-0006-00(476)

Attached is the escalation letter from Reeves Construction Co. for the above project.
Additional information forthcoming{Matt)

Lynn Bean

District Utilities Engineer
District Two, Tennille, Ga.
478 552-4646 Office
478 232-3338 Cell

The Georgia DOT spent approximately $15 miliion in 2013-2014 for 135 fast-tracked projects under the Quick Response
program to reduce traffic congestion and improve operations across Georgia. Quick Response projects are typically under
$200,000 on the state route system and funded from state motor fuel fax. Visit us at hitp:/fwww.dot.ga.gov/iwinterweather ;
or follow us on hitp://iwww facebook.com/GeorgiaDOT and hitp:/twitter.com/gadeptoftrans




’ FS'MDTER_ .

' ClVli. / ENViRONMENTAL / :TRANSPORI‘ATION _:
Lo 'CONSULTING ENGINEERS - -
5 : www HOFSTADTER com.. o

March 13 2014

_ ' "'r Ja ames Snnth

':strlct Englneer
BAL DOT

Tenmllc GA 31089 : ::.-_ IR

e -:_R_é: 1 Utlhtv Relocatron Ga. Hwy 117
S Eastman, GA
- H&A File No. 2020-195

.;’"Dear Jamcs

ReE Thls letter is wrrtten m response to the Department’s letter dated February 17, 2014,
-._'denyiug the Clty of Eastman s request for atility aid. ‘The reason given for denial was that the
© - request came after the Department’s project was under construction. While this is true, the City
L was ot informed of the Department s project until after construction had begun., Additionally.
S the Ctty dues not ha\c money in the FY 2014 budgel to complete this relocation. In order for the
B ';.Cm Y (.0111piete the rLlcu,at:cm the City would need to include the cost in next year’s (FY2015)
- -budget, “The City would also need to survey, design, bid and award the line in conflict. We
" estimate that this would take between 8 and 12 months to compiete and would not fall within the
s Department s Completion Schedule. :

: If you should have any questions or need additional information, please don't hesitate to
ceall o I

Sincerely,

Pro;ect Engmeer
Ce:  Mr. Matthew Sammons
~ Mr. Lynn Bean
Ms. Bea Edge

‘CB/maj

4571 Arkwright Road / Macon, GA 31210 “
Phone: 478-757-1169 / Fax: 478-471-1646
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